
China–Turkey Relations 
from the Perspective of 
Neoclassical Realism

Mustafa Cüneyt Özşahin1 , Federico Donelli2
and Riccardo Gasco3

Abstract

There is plenty of studies focusing on China’s global outreach through its Belt 
and Road Initiative (BRI). In tandem with this, the extensive literature on China 
depicts it as the next hegemon to succeed in the USA. Along this line, flourishing 
ties with various Asian nations, including the Middle Eastern countries, as a result 
of China’s recent foreign policy activism has been addressed extensively. While 
most research has been stressing the rising assertiveness of China in world 
politics, only a limited number of studies have touched upon the responses 
from middle or small powers against China’s ascent. Drawing from neoclassical 
realism, this article contends two levels of analysis for delineating the interaction 
between Turkey, a middle power, and China, a rising great power. First, the 
exchange between Turkey and the USA is vital in determining the cordial 
relations between Turkey and China. Alteration in the American policy vis-à-vis 
Turkey in the wake of the Arab Spring is relevant to Turkey’s growing relations 
with China. Second, is the rising anti-Westernism of foreign policy elites as part 
of the alteration in the strategic culture of Turkish politics, which makes Turkey’s 
rapprochement with China possible. Nevertheless, it should be noted that these 
two levels are intertwined and feed each other. Consequently, employing a 
neoclassical realist approach, the article argues that the middle powers’ stance 
against a rising hegemon is conditional upon the bilateral relations with the 
current hegemon and peculiarities of domestic politics.
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Introduction

There is a widespread consensus that the international system is going through a 
period of structural change distinguished by the rise of China, a new great power 
able to challenge the American leadership. The Sino-American competition 
would reflect a pattern of recurring international system dynamics: hegemonic or 
power transition. Recently, the peaceful rise argument1 rebuffed with the 
development in Chinese foreign policy with the tenure of Xi Jinping (Chang-
Liao, 2018; Chang-Liao, 2019; Layne, 2020). The reconfiguration of the 
economic and political environment resulting from the rising of China has 
uncertain implications for other small and middle powers, especially for their 
relations with the United States.

According to some studies, during the transition of great powers, others, 
especially middle powers, are led to group themselves into two large coalitions 
between those who back the power in decline and those who support the challenger. 
Over the past few years, Turkey, a middle power2 with historical, political, and 
economic ties to the USA and the West, would seem to be taking stances 
increasingly akin to China. Indeed, despite China’s rising influence in the Middle 
East, Turkey has not opted to counteract the Chinese initiatives in the region. On 
the contrary, Turkey has unexpectedly sought to cement ties with Beijing since the 
late 2010s. Turkey–China relations seem to have gained momentum in recent 
years following Turkey’s straining ties with the Western bloc (Kumar, 2013). The 
reasons behind Turkey’s recent overture to China still needs to be addressed. 
What has driven the decisions of Turkish policymakers? Are the gains of such a 
policy real or only perceived?

Despite a good amount of scholarly work describing current Turkey–China 
relations, very few studies prove a theoretical framework that extends beyond 
anecdotal explanations. By analyzing the way Sino-Turkish relations have 
developed over the last two decades, the article seeks to problematize the choices 
of the middle power’s policymakers. This study contends that middle powers 
have no predetermined behavior toward the rising great power or challenger. 
Instead, it argues that the structure of the international environment and the 
domestic politics of a particular middle power together shape the strategy of that 
state in the course of power transition. In other words, the main hypothesis is that 
the determinants should be traced in the constant interaction between international 
and domestic politics. Accordingly, Turkey’s rapprochement with China can be 
better explored through the prism of neoclassical realism, which allows grasping 
the intertwining of domestic and systemic dimensions.

Therefore, to unfold the dynamics behind Turkey’s foreign policy behavior 
within the new global context, one ought to look at the two levels of analysis.3 
First, relations between the hegemon (the USA) and the middle power (Turkey) 
are of significance in shaping the relations of the latter with the challenger 
(China). Accordingly, in the present case, it is maintained that Turkey’s policy 
toward China largely hinges on the shape of Turkey–US relations. Second, in 
addition to the American posture toward Turkey, the growing anti-Westernism in 
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Turkey’s domestic environment has given rise to seeking alternative venues for 
foreign policy.

Given all these considerations, this research is sub-divided into three sections. 
Where the first section outlines the main historical steps of Turkey–China 
relations, the second assesses the relevance of neoclassical realist’s theoretical 
framework in addressing Turkey–China relations to explain Turkish foreign 
policy behavior during the global power transition. Following this, last section 
make some inferences concerning middle power-rising global power relations in 
light of overlapping structural and domestic factors. Thus, the research aim is 
twofold: to contribute to the emerging literature on the Sino-Turkish relations and 
to provides insight on how a middle or secondary power behaves during a great 
power transition.

The Initial Periods in Turkey–China Relations: Engaging 
with the Dragon

Until now, a strong strand of literature has overly stressed China’s global expansion 
with a specific emphasis on the Belt and Road Initiative (BRI), meaning that the 
bulk of these studies contextualize the issue from the perspective of hegemonic 
transition. The rising Chinese influence in the Middle East and growing rapport 
between China and Middle Eastern states are well articulated from the Chinese 
perspective. Nevertheless, only a few studies draw attention to the responses from 
the middle and small powers vis a vis the changing global landscape. There is vast 
research on the global resurgence of China and its regional effects. For many 
studies, China is far from being a threat to global order yet a “responsible 
shareholder” in the liberal world order (Johnston, 2003; Xiang, 2001). Liberal 
pundits such as Ikenberry argue that China is a part of the liberal world order 
rather than the opposite (Ikenberry, 2008). However, on the other hand, a more 
realist tradition highlights that it is indispensable for China to assert its hegemony 
sooner or later (Mearsheimer, 2010, 2014). Also, it is well addressed that China is 
preponderant power in East Asia that made itself evident in regional affairs. In this 
regard, China has been adopting a “strategic, development-oriented approach” 
toward the neighboring small states (Tiang Boon & Ardy, 2017, p. 129).

However, it should be noted that China attempts to expand its influence beyond 
East Asia by fostering ties with Middle Eastern nations, including Turkey. On this 
account, more Middle East-focused inquiries address China’s role in the Middle 
East with a particular focus on China’s economic and energy-motivated foreign 
policy.4 However, research on this topic has been exclusively focusing on China’s 
perspective, only limited emphasis on regional middle and small powers have 
been put so far. No doubt that such a caveat can also be detected in China–Turkey 
relations as did other middle and small powers.

China and Turkey have a long history traced back to ancient times. The 
literature regarding the blinkers between Turks and Chinese in East Asia portrays 
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Hun Turks and Chinese as arch enemies. However, historical records reveal that 
two entities were first encountered during the Tang dynasty (Fidan, 2016). In a 
more recent period, the Ottoman–Chinese interaction returned to the Abdülaziz 
era in terms of connection with Turkestan and subsequently Abdülhamit II-era 
centering on the orchestrating of the Chinese Muslims in the region (Ersoy, 2008, 
pp. 57–58). Scholarship on Sino-Turkish diplomatic relations, on the other hand, 
addresses relatively late history by particularly focusing on the aftermath of the 
Turkish Republic. Formal diplomatic ties date back to 1971, when the relations 
were established (Çolakoğlu 2015, p. 7; Kumar, 2013, p. 134).5 Bilateral relations 
henceforth continued in a low profile for a long period.

During the earlier period of the Cold War, Turkey–China relations were shaped 
in the shade of ideological rivalry. Drawing from structural realism, Çolakoğlu 
stresses the role of systemic pressures that shape the trajectory of China–Turkey 
relations during the Cold War to a large extent. For example, between 1950 and 
1970, “anti-communist solidarity” has a crucial bearing on Turkey–China 
relations. As such, Turkey sought to form diplomatic relations with Japan, Taiwan/
Republic of China, and South Korea against pro-communist states (Çolakoğlu, 
2012, pp. 129–133). On the other hand, China attempted to reach most of the 
developing countries through its radio broadcast as part of propaganda operations. 
Radio Peking’s Turkish section was one of those endeavors targeting Turkey, 
which took effect in 1957 (Üngör, 2012). After the 1970s, on the other hand, 
relations gained momentum between the two sides with the easing tension 
between the USA and China (Çolakoğlu, 2012, p. 134).

Another factor enabling Turkey’s rapprochement with China stems from 
conjectural crises with the West. It is a widely stressed fact that one of the structural 
determinants of Turkish Foreign Policy (hereafter, TFP) is its western orientation. 
Nevertheless, there were occasions when Turkey strayed away from such a 
unidirectional foreign policy. For example, the Cyprus issue, one of the momentous 
occasions in TFP, paved the way for the emergence of versatile foreign policy 
with a more independent character in the 1970s. Accordingly, this enabled Turkey 
to engage with a myriad of Third World countries, many of which had earlier on, 
never been in its foreign policy agenda (Çolakoğlu, 2012, p. 134). Added to this, 
during the 1980s, not only economic ties flourished, but also diplomatic exchanges 
accelerated between parties.

Therefore, President Kenan Evren’s visit to China in 1982 is not a coincidence 
as bilateral relations kicked off with this visit. Even though the US–China 
rapprochement remained a significant determinant in TFP, other international 
factors became decisive in Turkey’s novel diplomacy toward China. Turkey, for 
instance, has paid special attention to boost diplomatic relations due to China’s 
permanent membership in the UN (Çolakoğlu, 2012, p. 138; Çolakoğlu, 2015, 
p. 8). However, there have also been certain drawbacks stemming from the 
Uyghur minority in China. China–Turkey relations strained because of so-called 
Turkish support to and of being a safe-haven for Uyghur separatists. Because of 
the multiple crises arose from the Uyghur issue, bilateral relations were far from 
being cordial during the 1990s (Çolakoğlu, 2012, p. 139; Çolakoğlu, 2015, pp. 
12–14; Ergenc, 2015, pp. 295–296). As such, both sides applied diplomatic 
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measures to have their interlocutor retreat. Nevertheless, Western denial to sell 
weapons to Turkey due to its human rights violation in its conflict with Kurdistan 
Worker’s Party (Partîya Karkerên Kurdistanê; PKK) initiated a new round of 
cooperation within the realm of the defense industry in the 1990s (Guo, 2017, p. 
78; Kumar, 2013, p. 134). To sum up, despite certain political disagreements 
between China and Turkey, relations based on economic and military exchanges 
between the two parties were sustained.

With the demise of the threat of communism after the collapse of the Soviet 
Union, Turkey–China relations diversified, encompassing economic, military, 
and cultural dimensions, although the economy was the building block of bilateral 
ties. With the emergence of China as an economic power and export hub in 
international trade, economic relations started to occupy an exclusive place (see, 
Atlı, 2011; Temiz, 2020). In this regard, while China was initially perceived as a 
massive market for Turkish exports while from the Chinese perspective, Turkey 
was considered to be a big market located in a strategic position between Asia and 
Europe (Çolakoğlu, 2010; Çolakoğlu, 2015, p. 8). Nevertheless, Atlı (2011, p. 
111) points out that even though there was rising “trade volume” between the 
parties, the “trade deficit” also rose for Turkey. Similarly, Temiz expressed that 
there has been an “asymmetrical interdependence” mostly because of the 
“competitive advantage” of China (Temiz, 2020). 

Turkish–Chinese Rapprochement During the 2000s: Reassessing 
the AKP Period

As opposed to differences between China and Turkey, mostly due to the Uygur 
issue during the 1990s, relations gained momentum, which coincided with the rise 
of the Justice and Development Party (Adalet ve Kalkınma Partisi, AKP). Apart 
from Chinese infrastructure mega-projects in Turkey, another step that is planned 
to move economic relations to another level is, for sure, the renowned Chinese 
project One Belt One Road (OBOR) Initiative (also known as Belt and Road 
Initiative or BRI ) as part of a New Silk Road (Chaziza, 2016, p. 276; Ergenc, 
2015, p. 191; Guo, 2017, p. 70; Lavi & Lindenstrauss, 2016, pp. 123–124). 
Furthermore, as stressed by Işık and Zou, Turkey–China rapprochement further 
intensified with Xi Jinping’s prominent BRI and the “Middle Corridor” approach 
put forward in 2010 (Isik & Zou, 2019, pp. 286–287). Moreover, on 5 August 
2019, the Turkish Minister of Foreign Affairs declared that Turkey initiated a new 
opening called the “Asia Anew” initiative. Before this move, Turkey had stepped 
up its effort by launching new embassies and joining multilateral organizations, 
including Shanghai Corporation Organization as a dialogue partner and ASEAN 
Sectoral Dialogue Partner (Alperen & Ersoy, 2019; Çolakoğlu, 2019a).

Despite the fact that there are multiple reasons to account for Turkey–China 
rapprochement, two primary motivations enable relations between two states. 
First, putting aside the transformation of China’s grand strategy from being a 
regional to global one,6 there are other determinants stemming from alterations in 
Turkey’s friend–enemy definitions. Although Turkey de-securitized its relations 
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with its neighbors under the dictum of “zero problems,” it generally deemed a 
historical moment as a deviation from the established foreign policy tradition 
(Walker, 2007). However, subsequent domestic (rising anti-westernism) and 
international developments (deteriorating relations with the West and the rise of 
China) changed the course of TFP in the following years.

Given the advancements mentioned above, it should not be wrong to claim that 
the Ankara–Beijing dimension gained a new face, especially after Turkey’s 
worsening economic condition. That is to say that Turkey was tormented with 
economic deprivation with low growth and high inflation rates, which necessitated 
seeking new financial sources to ensure its economic growth. Because of the 
bedeviled relations with the West, China emerged as an alternative route for 
financial needs as well. According to the Anatolian Agency, Turkey plans to 
receive a US$10 billion loan from the Industrial and Commercial Bank of China 
(ICBC) for infrastructure and energy projects (Aliyev, 2018). However, Turkish–
China relations are, by no means, restricted to economy, and both sides give 
signals of the establishment of security cooperation in recent years. As such, since 
the Premier Wen Jiabao’s visit to Turkey, which took place in 2010, bilateral 
relations intensified with “high-level dialogue on military cooperation,” joint 
military training, and negotiation over arms exports (Isik & Zou, 2019, pp. 285–
286). Particularly, Turkey’s search for an air defense system and the transfer of 
military technology became pivotal for the Turkish–Chinese relations instead of 
economic relations dominating bilateral dialogue between two states.

As Kumar stresses deterioration of relations with the USA and EU, especially 
on the issues of sanctions and arms transfers, compels Turkey to seek new partners 
(Kumar, 2013, p. 134). It should also be noted that Chinese and Russian companies 
emerged as potential arms dealers against the USA and European alternatives, 
most of whose government suspended military arms sales to Turkey, which further 
alienated Turkey from the West. Turkey’s venture into purchasing missile defense 
system FD-2000, also known as HQ-9 from the Chinese military firm CPMEIC 
(Guo, 2017, pp. 69–70), was mostly regarded as another sign of Ankara’s 
detachment from the West. However, Xiaoli argues that Turkey’s purchasing of 
the Chinese missile system was not just based on mere military consideration but 
was also a “leverage” vis-à-vis NATO and its western allies (Guo, 2017, pp. 
86–87).

Similarly, Chaziza stresses that “Beijing has the potential to provide Ankara 
with great economic, political and strategic opportunities as well as military 
technology, and to afford it a certain degree of leverage vis-a-vis Washington in 
its policy choices” (Chaziza, 2016, p. 278). Although Turkey’s venture into buying 
the Chinese air defense system failed (Onuş, 2015), Russia–Turkish military 
dialogue, on the other hand, ended with an agreement to purchase S-400 missile 
system, which was being delivered in 2019 (Reuters, 2019). Corollary to this, 
such a prospect for military cooperation stirred tension between NATO members 
and Turkey. As a long-time NATO member, Turkey’s military endeavors were 
seen as adventurism leading to a potential threat to the US-led Western conventional 
security order. In response to the purchase of S-400 systems from Russia, Ankara 
was expelled from the F-35 program, where it had been one of the long-standing 
partners (Deutsche Welle, 2019a).

6



Özşahin et al.	 7

In addition to this, one of the tools employed by the AKP government to resolve 
the financial crisis has been swap arrangements with China and the first swap deal 
was signed in 2012. Following this, it was prolonged for three years until 2015 
and fully realized in 2016. The swap deal was renewed in 2019 (Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs, n.d.).7 The two sides developed ties in health diplomacy during 
the COVID 19 pandemic. Turkey opted for the Chinese Sinovac vaccine by 
sideling the USA and EU-based alternatives despite concerns over its efficiency. 
However, it has come to light that delays in vaccine deliveries were a step by 
China to force Ankara’s cooperation over the extradition of Uighurs (Tavşan, 
2021). Arguably, the accelerated economic and military exchange between the 
two sides had repercussions over time, including Turkey’s retreat from its 
traditional guardianship role for the Uighur minority. Beijing and Ankara signed 
an extradition treaty in 2017 that was ratified Chinese National People’s Congress 
in 2020 (Euro News, 2020). Moreover, Chinese authorities had occasionally 
warned Turkey over the Uighur issue by emphasizing its increasing economic 
dependence on Beijing (Euro News, 2019).

Neoclassical Realism: A Framework for Analysis

Over the last two decades, neoclassical realism, whose purpose is to investigate 
the states’ foreign policy, has become one of the most widespread approaches to 
studying international relations. Drawing from the founding names of classical 
realists, neoclassical realist critiques neorealism thoroughly (Quinn, 2013). 
Notwithstanding this critique, neoclassical realism upholds power distribution in 
international system/structure as its base for its analysis (Rathbun, 2008, p. 297; 
Rynning, 2001, p. 90; Taliaferro et al., 2009, pp. 20–21). While neoclassical 
realists acknowledge the dominant role of the international system over units, 
they highlight domestic politics as intervening variables that ought to be taken 
into consideration (Donelli 2020, p. 226; Kitchen, 2010; Rose, 1998, pp. 146, 
152–154). Consequently, it can be argued that the principal claim of neoclassical 
realism is that foreign policy output is the consequence of the complex exchange 
between state level and structural factors.

Second, neoclassical realism interrogates the primacy of the balance of power 
assumption of the neorealist theory of IR. In contrast to neorealism, neoclassical 
realism does not take the balance of power behavior as a rule of thumb by 
emphasizing under-balancing as a foreign policy behavior as common as the 
balancing (Schweller, 2004, p. 164; Taliaferro, 2000, p. 135). Unlike neorealism, 
neoclassical realism offers a theoretical framework for states’ foreign policy other 
than giving a structural insight based on power distribution (Wohlforth, 2008, p. 
35). Thus, it clarifies the above-mentioned anomalies in the balancing behavior of 
middle and small powers contrary to the pre-given patterns of neorealist schools. 
For these reasons, a body of literature utilized neoclassical realism to account for 
middle and small powers’ foreign policy behaviors.8

Neoclassical realists specifically highlight that states follow foreign policies 
based on their perception of power distribution and the nature of threats. In this 
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context, domestic variables stand out as crucial explanatory shedding light on 
variants of foreign policy outputs in neoclassical realism. Hence, neoclassical 
realism aims to revise neorealism with the inclusion of the state level, which is 
construed as a black box by neorealists. To put it differently, neoclassical realists 
revise the systemic holism of neo-realists by incorporating actor-centered 
specificities (Finel, 2001). Neoclassical realists’ another recurring topic is the 
relationship between state leaders or the foreign policy executive (FPE) and the 
people. From a neoclassical realist perspective, state leaders or FPE exist at the 
interface of the international/structural and the domestic layers. Accordingly, 
foreign policy decisions were not made in a vacuum and the FPE are crucial actors 
in decision-making processes (Lobell, 2009; Saltzman, 2015, p. 502). Hence, in 
this line, it can be maintained that decision-makers’ worldviews have a strong 
bearing on foreign policy decisions (Mowle, 2003). Significantly, “complex threat 
assessment” of decision-makers factors systemic, sub-state and domestic level 
threat perceptions into the analysis (Lobell, 2009, pp. 46–54).

Moreover, in parallel to the general tendency to combine constructivist and 
realist approaches in IR (Barkin, 2003; Jackson & Nexon, 2004; See also Nau, 
2002 neoclassical realists also underline the perspectives over constraints and 
opportunities of the international system by incorporating culture, identity and 
norms in their analysis (Kitchen, 2010; Sterling-Folker, 2009). The ideational 
factors such as nationalism are particularly useful because they render decision-
makers to “extract, mobilize, and direct societal resources and cultivate support 
among its power base” (Taliaferro et al., 2009, p. 38). To summarize, the 
neoclassical theory considers the foreign policy behavior of the states as a 
correlation of external factors as influenced by, or in the function of, some internal 
intervening factors.

Turkey–China Relations Through the Prism of 
Neoclassical Realists

Emphasizing the role of state-level factors, strategic assessment and policymakers’ 
perception, neoclassical realism advances a two-level theory of foreign policy. 
As a result, foreign policy behavior is determined by a constant strain between 
domestic and international spheres. Domestic policy factors and assessments 
may lead FPEs or leaders to take peculiar actions in the international context. In 
some cases, what represents a challenge from an international perspective is 
perceived as an opportunity at a domestic level and vice versa. To understand the 
prospects for Sino-Turkish relations, it is necessary to analyze the rationales that 
lead Turkish FPEs to view China as either an opportunity or a challenge. The 
neoclassical analytical framework enables the examination of two variables 
which are considered crucial to understanding the Turkish choice of approaching 
Beijing: the relationship between the dominant power in decline (US) and the 
middle power (Turkey) during the phases of structural change; and the 
transformation of the strategic culture of Turkish FPEs. The international 

8



Özşahin et al.	 9

environment, as well as the relative power, determine the room for maneuver of 
a middle power. Strategic culture, on the other hand, clarifies how the middle 
power intends to exploit that space.

The article argues that domestic political considerations have driven Turkey’s 
move to boost relations with China alongside the systemic incentives. The Sino-
Turkish relations should be understood within the broader framework of TFP, 
which has gone through multiple changes since the beginning of the new millennium. 
With the rise of AKP, Turkey emerged as an “emerging regional power,” claiming 
a new role in the international system (Parlar Dal, 2016). Arguably, this is closely 
related to the reduced US engagement in the Middle East that began during the 
Obama administration and perpetuated during the Trump administration (Yom, 
2020). Accordingly, consistent throughout the last two decades has been the purpose 
of the Turkish FPEs: the increase of Turkey’s international status with the changing 
global balance in the late 2000s. In this context, the means used to achieve this goal 
have been the diversification of economic and political relations and increased 
autonomy in foreign policy (Oğuzlu, 2018, pp. 128–129).

Meanwhile, one of the distinctive traits of the modern Middle East has remained 
unchanged: the high permeability to external influences. In this regard, 
Washington’s de-prioritization of the region has generated a space partially filled 
by Russia and China (Oğuzlu, 2018, p. 129). China’s increased presence alongside 
Russia in the region can be regarded as the harbinger of a changing security 
environment in the Middle East. However, it is difficult to predict whether this 
change will be permanent or ephemeral. Consequently, Middle Eastern states, 
most of which have strong political and security ties with the USA, have crafted 
strategies to reposition themselves within this emerging environment.

The Status of Secondary States During Great Power Transition

During the great power transition, the attitude of middle powers is an important 
issue to be examined but still understudied. Especially, the nexus among 
secondary state-hegemon power and rising power is crucial in determining the 
foreign policy behavior of the secondary states. By emphasizing the economic 
power hub, Ikenberry argues that middle states have been vacillating between 
China as an economic power and the USA as a security provider in the East Asian 
context (Ikenberry, 2016). Investigating the relationship between great power 
(China) and middle power (Iran), Conduit and Akbarzade emphasize that middle 
powers can be an asset as potential allies against the hegemonic force, but at the 
same such a coalition can also carry a danger of pushing great power into a 
conflict with the hegemon (Conduit & Akbarzadeh, 2019). On the other hand, 
Lebow, Jesse, and Williams highlight the influence of hegemonic power on 
systemic and sub-systemic levels as well as the role of rising powers in a 
particular region in determining the secondary and tertiary states’ foreign policy 
behavior (Lobell et al., 2015).

Nevertheless, none of the studies hitherto mentioned exclusively emphasize 
the role of domestic factors. In contrast with the previous literature, Gilley and 
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O’Neil state that “generating hypotheses about the specific content of the middle 
power behavior depends not only on the nature of the international system but 
also on distinctive domestic, political, economic and cultural conditions that are 
present in the ranks of middle powers” (Gilley & O’Neil 2014, p. 9). Departing 
from this viewpoint, Gilley investigates the dynamics at China (rising power)—
Canada (middle power)—the United States (hegemonic power) triangle and 
concludes that the US–Canada relations were resistant to any change not only 
because of ‘structural interests’ of these two states but also the normative 
commonalities based on liberal values in the face of rising power, China (Gilley, 
2011). In parallel to the point raised above, Umut Aydın (2021) argues that 
emerging middle powers may renounce the traditional roles they were expected to 
play in defense of the international liberal order. By contrast, they might become 
disruptive forces in respect of the global liberal order due to deteriorating 
democratic freedoms in their own backyard. He sheds light on this point by 
referring to Turkey and Mexico as two antagonists of the values and institutions 
underpinning the international liberal order (Aydın, 2021).

It is imperative to look into Turkey–US relations in the post-Arab Spring to 
grasp Turkey–China relations. Turkey and the USA have historically gone through 
up-and-down phases. Nevertheless, Ankara and Washington could cope with 
them until recently because none of the incidents had affected the tie at its core. 
The international environment was also instrumental in overcoming tensions. 
Especially from the Turkish perspective, both during the Cold War and in the 
following two decades, the systemic structure offered no realistic alternative to 
the relationship with the USA. Yet during the first decade of the AKP government, 
the two countries found common ground for cooperation within the framework of 
the so-called American Greater Middle East Initiative (Yurdusev, 2006). Therefore, 
the renewed Turkish ambitions and the quest for greater autonomy in regional 
politics did not generate tensions with the US ally.

However, these ties were deteriorated in the following years due to deep 
divergences on two issues: the Syrian crisis and the 15 July coup attempt. Turkey’s 
assertive approach to the region based on soft power took a new form after the 
eruption of the Arab Spring, which was seen as a window of opportunity for AKP 
elites (Özpek & Demirağ, 2014). As the Syrian crisis worsened, Turkey blamed 
the USA for not supporting its policy of counterbalancing the influence of Iran 
and Russia, both of which strove to keep disintegrating Assad’s rule intact 
(Altunışık, 2020; Đidić & Kösebalaban, 2019; Ovalı & Özdikmenli 2020, pp. 
115–116). The strain between Washington and Ankara deflagrated with the 
advance of the Islamic State into Syrian soil. The USA opted to engage in a war 
of proxy by supporting Kurdish fighters, including the People’s Protection Units 
(YPG). Turkey considers these militias as the Syrian branch of the banned terrorist 
organization PKK.9 The American support for the YPG was a breaking point in 
the Turkey–US relationship (Ovalı & Özdikmenli, 2020, p. 115). To counter the 
influence of the YPG, which Turkey considers a main national security threat, 
Turkish FPEs opted to form issue-oriented alignment on the ground with Russia 
and Iran through the Astana process (Cengiz, 2019).
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The second incident that further strained the relations was the attitude of US 
decision-makers following the failed coup attempt of 2016. The late and meager 
American response led to disappointment among the AKP political elite and 
significant parts of the Turkish public. Furthermore, the US decision to refuse the 
extradition of Fethullah Gülen, considered by Turkish authorities to be responsible 
for the coup, has increased mistrust toward the long-standing ally (Kanat, 2020). 
Moreover, the official narrative of the failed coup has progressively encapsulated 
anti-Western rhetoric that, as we will see in the next section, has driven Turkey 
closer to China. Similarly, Turkey–EU dialogue came to a halt in 2016 after the 
opposition from Cyprus and France due to Turkey’s refusal abandon its legal 
commitments concerning Cyprus and French regulations over the accession 
process, respectively (Directorate of EU Affairs, 2019). Furthermore, Turkey was 
harshly criticized by the EU due to its human rights violations committed against 
journalists, political activists, and academics. As of 2019, the tension between the 
two sides escalated to a new level that the European Parliament brought up the 
suspension of Turkey’s membership into the debate (Deutsche Welle, 2019b). 
Moreover, both the USA and the EU resorted to the sanction threat over Turkey’s 
purchase of S-400 and Turkish activism in the Mediterranean energy scramble 
(Norman et al., 2020).

In the face of the rising tensions with both the USA and the EU, Turkey drifted 
into isolation, impelling it to seek new partners. Unsurprisingly, China as the 
challenger to the American leadership emerged as one of the most favorable 
options Turkey would consider. As mentioned, there is a body of literature on 
global power transition giving a specific emphasis on the rise of China. Also, this 
line of research also dovetailed with the end of the American hegemony debate. 
It is well-addressed that China is shaking the US hegemony in East Asia 
(Ikenberry, 2004).

Nevertheless, it would not be wrong to argue that China’s global ambitions 
expanded well beyond its near abroad. According to Chaziza, China has been soft 
balancing the USA rather than hard balancing in the Middle East for some time 
now (Chaziza, 2014). On the other hand, Chang highlights that China became 
more visible than ever in the Middle East, especially after the Arab Spring with 
the Syrian crisis (Chang, 2014). China’s regional agenda, known as the “1+2+3 
Strategy,” was introduced in 2014 to build new cooperative relationships with all 
regional actors based on three dimensions or pillars: energy, investment and trade 
(Fulton, 2020). Like other regional players, Turkish FPEs saw the growing 
Chinese footprint as an opportunity to diversify their trade relations. Although 
China has come to the forefront as a rising great power with huge economic 
potential, it became more complicated to establish trade synergies for Turkey due 
to several reasons: First, the trade deficit between the two sides reached a record 
level in favor of China (Atlı, 2011, pp. 109–111; Çetingüleç, 2019; Dellios & 
Yilmaz, 2008, pp. 17–18). Second, the growing presence of Chinese companies in 
third-party contexts such as Africa threatens to reduce further space for Turkish 
companies (Sano, 2018).

The rise of China and the simultaneous American decline have created a more 
permissive international environment. The structural change has given a chance to 
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status-seeking middle powers such as Turkey to implement more enterprising 
behavior. The prospect of increasing relations with China, like what Turkey has 
done with Russia, has become a lever or bargaining chip in relations with the 
West. FPEs are aware of Turkey’s relevance for the West and, in particular, the 
USA. A strategic prominence is bound to increase further precisely because of the 
growing Chinese presence in the region. As a result, Turkish FPEs have sought to 
maximize the gains of their relationship with Washington by raising the specter of 
a shift toward China. In other words, China stood out as a rising global power with 
a huge economic and military potential as Turkish FPEs were bound by constraints 
imposed by other global power centers.

FPEs Shift and the Anti-Western Sentiments

Some scholars consider that one of the main reasons for Turkey’s rapport with 
China is its attitude toward the West (see Kumar, 2013). Particularly after the Gezi 
protests, which were claimed to have been orchestrated by foreign powers, alluding 
to Western governments, Erdoğan heralded that “Turkey is ready to ink free trade 
agreements with countries in Eurasia” (Taş, 2014). According to Lavi and 
Lindenstrauss, “the frustration with the West and even the basic hostility to what 
is sometimes perceived as neo-imperialism are to a large degree shared by China 
and Turkey” (Lavi & Lindenstrauss, 2016, p. 125). According to Dellios and 
Yılmaz (2008, pp. 21–22), despite the asymmetries between the two nations in 
terms of size and resources, there are also similarities, such as both of these states 
are, historically, “outside the Western system” and “strong states” in terms of their 
hard power capabilities. Such attributes enable further cooperation under the 
umbrella of the “Shanghai Cooperation Organization,” in which Turkey became a 
“dialogue partner” (Dellios & Yilmaz, 2008, p.29; Parlar Dal, 2016, p. 16).

One can maintain that the current transformation in Turkish foreign policy 
could be assigned to an alteration in the perspectives of political elites. In 
retrospect, Turkey was generally depicted as a “torn country” with the westernized 
elites and conservative society (Huntington, 1997, pp. 74, 144–149). From the 
late Ottoman period to the modern Republic, Turkish modernization was a project 
carried out through the bureaucratic elites (Heper, 2001; Trimberger, 1978). These 
bureaucratic elites fostered a strategic culture that paved the way for a western-
oriented and non-interventionist foreign policy, which underpins the strategic 
culture in foreign policymaking. In line with this, Karaosmanoğlu, for example, 
stresses that “since the 18th century, the process of Westernization has left its 
imprint on the national security culture. It has greatly motivated Turkey’s Western-
oriented policies and introduced liberal and internationalist elements into foreign 
policy” (Karaosmanoǧlu, 2000, p. 200). Mufti, on the other hand, emphasizes the 
“strong bias in favor of the geopolitical status quo; and a powerful aversion to 
foreign entanglement,” as another plank of strategic culture (Mufti, 2009, p. 3).

The pivotal change in Turkish foreign policy was the strategic culture of the 
FPEs during the AKP period. A variety of studies has highlighted this paradigm 
shift. As such, there is a body of literature revolving around Turkey’s new foreign 
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policy quest, emphasizing multidimensionality in terms of diplomacy toward the 
non-western world. For example, Erdağ & Kardaş (2013) scrutinize the change in 
the strategic culture during AKP’s tenure with a specific emphasis on Davutoglu’s 
diplomacy based on “multidimensional and active foreign policy” covering the 
neglected countries of the non-western world for so long (Erdağ & Kardaş, 2013, 
p. 87). Moreover, another stream of research focuses on the rising autonomy of 
TFP. In this line, Öniş and Kutlay stress Turkey became “critical of the existing 
Western-led world order” and “inclined to pursue delegitimization strategies” 
(Öniş & Kutlay, 2017, p. 181). In parallel to these statements, Yeşiltas highlights 
that Turkey has been after a new civilizational identity in “a search for anti-
hegemony” (Yeşiltaş, 2014, p. 44). Similarly, Özkan opines that Turkey and 
Brazil, as two middle powers, attempted to broker a new deal with Iran which can 
be viewed “as milestones in the rise of non-Western powers” (Özkan 2010, p. 30).

In the light of the foregoing studies, it can be argued that Turkey diversified 
its foreign policy to cultivate new ties with the non-western world. Nevertheless, 
the strategic culture has evolved from non-westernism in terms of 
multidimensionality and autonomy to anti-westernism in the later AKP period. 
With the benefit of hindsight, it can be seen that this strategic culture-shifting 
process has gained momentum following the failed coup attempt on July 15, 
2016. Arguably, the main determinant was the reshuffle within Turkish FPEs, 
that paved the way for the inception of a new strategic culture: Eurasianism.10 
The rise of the Eurasianist perspective, not new in TFP, is related to the power 
struggle within FPEs to fill the vacuum left by the wave of arrests of Gülenist 
affiliates and by the sidelining of cadres close to the former Prime Minister 
Ahmet Davutoglu. Among the factions that have acquired more influence is the 
so-called Perinçek group. The group, which revolves around the leader of the 
arch-secularist and ultranationalist Vatan Party, Doğu Perinçek, is known for its 
staunchly secular, isolationist, socialist, anti-West and Eurasianist characteristics 
(Çolakoğlu, 2019b; Donelli 2020, p. 242; Üngör, 2019, pp. 69–70). Endorsing its 
anti-western rhetoric, decision-makers have recently highlighted Turkey’s 
distinctiveness and authenticity more frequently than ever. As one of the leading 
figures amongst the AKP political elite, İbrahim Kalın attests this by stating that 
“we have told the stories of others in the name of modernization. Now it is time 
to write our own story” (Kalın, 2018).

At the international level, the Turkish anti-Western rhetoric11 has a twofold 
facet. It is being used by Turkish FPEs to bolster Turkey’s image among the 
countries of the Global South and within specific regional agendas (Levaggi & 
Donelli, 2021). In the first case, Turkey promotes a comprehensive reform of 
global governance epitomized by the motto “the world is bigger than five” (Aral, 
2019; Yeşiltaş, 2014, pp. 44–45). In the second case, anti-western rhetoric finds 
its place in policies toward particular regions, such as Africa, where Turkey 
exploits this narrative to differentiate its involvement from former colonial 
powers. In the African context, anti-western rhetoric bears the hallmarks of anti-
imperialism (Abdirahman, 2013, pp. 72–73; Langan, 2017). This point was 
invoked on a variety of platforms. For instance, Erdoğan’s speech at the University 
of Khartoum stressed that “there is no moral value imperialists won’t contravene 
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for a drip of oil, Africa is the continent that best knows that fact,” illustrates this 
very explicitly (Daily Sabah, 2015).

This anti-Western stance has been prompted by shifts within the FPE and new 
domestic political concerns as the government alliance shifts toward the right. In 
addition, numerous divergencies with Western allies on regional policy issues 
have fueled anti-western sentiments among the Turkish public. Moreover, rising 
nationalism and anti-Western rhetoric have provided a window of opportunity for 
a new partnership (the so-called Cumhur Alliance) between the AKP and the 
Nationalist Movement Party (MHP) (Altunışık, 2020, p. 15; Yavuz & Ozcan, 
2019, pp. 86–88; see also Levaggi & Donelli, 2021, p. 1108). That is to say that 
the current political equilibrium in Turkey has also pushed JDP to drift toward 
anti-western rhetoric. In this regard, anti-western rhetoric has been closely 
associated with rising political populism in Turkey, which has also had 
repercussions on Turkish diplomacy vis-à-vis Western capitals (Göksel, 2019; 
Kaliber & Kaliber, 2019).

Nevertheless, it should also be noted that anti-western sentiments have much 
deeper roots in the Islamic world, which far exceed the tactical employment of 
anti-western rhetoric in the current politics of Turkey (see Aydın, 2007). As part 
of the rising anti-western populism following the 15 Julycoup attempt, Turkey 
justified its domestic and foreign policy based on “native and national (yerli ve 
milli)” discourse (Üngör, 2019, p. 68). Accordingly, rising nationalism, intertwined 
with anti-westernism, has also propped up the development of intimate relations 
with China. While fostering an increase in Chinese investment in the country, this 
development has also reduced Turkish autonomy on political issues such as 
Beijing’s treatment of Uighurs.

Conclusion

This study analyses the behavior of a middle power during the great power 
transition period. Assuming Turkey is a middle power, the research uses Turkey’s 
rapprochement with China as a case study and examines it through the lens of 
neoclassical realism. What has been shown is that it is impossible to assess the 
actions of the middle power (Turkey) to the rising great power (China) without 
considering its relationship with the declining great power (US). Furthermore, 
domestic policy assessments also play an important role in these decision-making 
processes. These shreds of evidence witness how foreign policy behavior is 
determined by the permanent two-level game. Accordingly, Turkey–China 
rapprochement has been evaluated within the framework of neoclassical realism, 
considered suitable for multi-layered analysis. The case study confers middle 
powers’ cooperative or conflictual behavior, in the face of an emerging power, 
contingents upon the nexus between the current hegemon and the middle power 
and the domestic sensitivities of a middle power. Considering TFP, one can argue 
that systemic factors and domestic politics overlap with each other under the rule 
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of AKP, enabling to cement new ties with China as the rising power. Deteriorations 
of relations with the Western bloc (the USA and the EU) and the spreading of anti-
Western sentiments among the Turkish public fed each other. In other words, both 
these factors facilitate recent Turkey–China relations. Following the mixture of 
status-seeking aspirations and rising anti-Westernism, Turkey has diverged from 
its (traditional) western-oriented foreign policy paradigm. Such a shift bank upon 
China that, as a hegemon-candidate, has turned into assertive power challenging 
western-centric international order.

Consequently, both of these countries’ abiding anti-western as well revisionist 
stances have converged. Nowadays, economic ties between China and Turkey are 
the most relevant dimension of bilateral relations. However, the relationship is 
asymmetric, and Chinese gains are higher than the Turkish ones. Further, the 
relationship has deepened beyond material exchanges and an additional factor 
that has facilitated the strengthening of ties is ideological. The emergence of a 
new strategic culture among Turkish FPEs and the spread of anti-Western 
sentiments among the AKP constituency have pushed Turkey toward looking at 
China as an alternative to the West.

It should be noted that these two ideational factors feed each other in a cycle 
indelibly intertwined with Turkish relations with the West. Theoretically, this 
study contends that if an analysis is based solely on power hierarchy and the 
middle powers’ position in the international system, the analysis would be 
erroneous. Hence, the article claims that no predetermined foreign policy behavior 
emanates from the distribution of power that is binding for all middle powers. It 
can be surmised that the intensity and durability of anti-westernism and nationalist 
aura, both of which are significant components of the new strategic culture in 
Turkey, will have a strong bearing on the trajectory of Turkey–China relations by 
shaping the perception of the foreign policy elites.
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Notes
1.	 For peaceful rise notion, see Glaser and Medeiros (2007).
2.	 There is a good body of literature emphasizing Turkey’s middle powerhood see for 

example Müftüler and Yüksel (1997), Oran (2010), Yalçın (2012), Hale (2013), Özkan 
(2006), Elik (2012), Parlar Dal (2018), Baba and Önsoy (2016), and Parlar Dal and 
Kurşun (2016).

3.	 For two level of analysis, see Putnam (1988).
4.	 See, for example, Rynhold (1996), Rubin (1998), Shichor (2006), Bianchi (2013), 

Chang (2014), and Keskin and Braun (2016).
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5.	 In terms of cultural exchange between two nations, relations have much deeper 
historical roots in that Turkey’s Sinology department in Ankara University dates back 
to the 1930s (see Ergenc, 2015, p. 292).

6.	 For the rivalry between China and the USA in East Asia and the posture of middle 
states, see Ikenberry (2016).

7.	 For possible repercussions of Turkish–China economic rapprochement including swap 
agreements, see Lerner (2020).

8.	 See, for example, Gvalia et al. (2013), Gvalia et al. (2019), and Rosa et al. (2020).
9.	 PKK has been a secessionist establishment operational in south-eastern Turkey and 

northern Iraq since the late 1970s and has been designated a terrorist organization by 
Turkey. For a review of PKK, see Criss (1995)

10.	 There is extensive literature with regards to the root and development of Eurasianism 
in Turkish Foreign Policy from a geopolitical perspective, see Akçali and Perinçek 
(2009), Aktürk (2015), Erşen (2013), Tüfekci (2017), and Çolakoğlu (2019b).

11.	 For the rise of anti-westernism in Turkish Foreign Policy from a neoclassical realist 
perspective, see Ovalı and Özdikmenli (2020). For other studies on anti-Westernism 
and TFP, see Göksel (2019), Kaliber and Kaliber (2019), and Taş (2014).
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